
  15 February 2008  
 
 

 
 
I refer to your letter of 21 January seeking information under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000.  My responses to the six requests you made are set out below. 
 
1. The address of Ian Richard Kyle Paisley and Fiona Margaret Elizabeth Paisley 

for electoral purposes prior to July 2006. 
 
 This information which you seek is personal data.  I am unable to take a decision on 

whether I should disclose it you until I have ascertained the attitude of Mr and Mrs 
Paisley.  I have written to them and will revert to you as soon as I have had an 
opportunity to consider any response received.  The exemption set out in section 40 of 
the 2000 Act is in point.  

 
2. The grounds, if any, submitted in applying to be registered at 1 Whitepark Road, 

Ballyallaght, Bushmills in August 2006. 
 
 I do not hold information of the description specified in your request.   
 
3. The address of Ian Richard Kyle Paisley and Fiona Margaret Elizabeth Paisley 

for electoral purposes in their application forms in January 2008.   
 
 Ian Richard Kyle Paisley – the information you seek is held by me with a view to its 

publication on or about 1 March in the list of additions to the electoral register.  You 
will then be entitled to inspect it free of charge in accordance with regulation 43 of the 
2001 Regulations.  At present I regard the information as personal data and feel 
unable to reach a decision on whether or not to make it available to you without first 
ascertaining the views of Mr Paisley.  In view of the short period of time that will 
elapse before the information becomes available to you by other means I believe it is 
reasonable in all the circumstances to withhold the information until 1 March when you 
will be able to exercise your statutory right of inspection.  The exemptions set out in 
sections 21, 22 and 40 of the 2000 Act are in point.  

 
 Fiona Margaret Elizabeth Paisley – I do not hold information of the description 

specified in your request.   
 
4. The grounds, if any, submitted for change of address for electoral purposes in 

January 2008. 
 
 I do not hold information of the description specified in your request. 
 
5. Copies of all correspondence between the above named and the Electoral Office 

re the above. 
 
 I enclose the following documents –  

 copy letter to Ian R K Paisley dated 11 January 2008  
 copy letter to Ian R K Paisley dated 16 January 2008  
 copy letter to Mrs F M E Paisley dated 16 January 2008. 

 
Please note that the addresses have been redacted for the reasons explained above.   



 
6. Details of any dates of occupancy of the properties by the above named and 

dates when the properties where assessed by the Valuation Office for rates 
assessment. 

 
 I do not hold information of the description specified in your request. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
 
 
 


